Regd. No. CHD/0093/2015-2017

Hargana Gouernment Gazette

EXTRAORDINARY
Published by Authority

© Govt. of Haryana
No. 140-2016/Ext.] CHANDIGARH, WEDNESDAY, AUGUST 31, 2016 (BHADRA 9, 1938 SAKA)

HARYANA VIDHAN SABHA SECRETARIAT
Notification
The 31st August, 2016

No.34-HLA of 2016/102.— The Haryana Legislative Assembly (Salary, Allowances and
Pension of Members) Amendment Bill, 2016 is hereby published for general information under
proviso to Rule 128 of the Rules of Procedure and Conduct of Business in the Haryana Legislative
Assembly:-

Bill No. 34- HLA of 2016

THE HARYANA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SALARY, ALLOWANCES AND
PENSION OF MEMBERS) AMENDMENT BILL, 2016

A
BILL

further to amend the Haryana Legislative Assemebly (Salary, Allowances and Pension of
Members) Act, 1975.

BE it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Sixty-seventh Year of the
Republic of India as follows:-

1. This Act may be called the Haryana Legislative Assembly (Salary, Allowances and Shorttitle.
Pension of Members) Amendment Act, 2016.

2. In section 2A of the Haryana Legislative Assembly (Salary, Allowances and Pension of ~Amendment
Members) Act, 1975 (hereinafter called the principal Act), for the words “thirty thousand rupees”, g; ﬁ;ﬁ)‘/‘;’r‘] aZA
the words “forty thousand rupees” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been act5 of 1975,

substituted with effect from the 1st April, 2016.

3. In section 3A of the principal Act, for the words “thirty thousand rupees”, the words “sixty ~ Amendment
thousand rupees” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect 8; ;e;“‘;’;:A
from the 1st April, 2016. Act z?,'f 1975.
4, In section 3B of the principal Act, for the words “five thousand rupees”, the words “ten ~ Amendment
thousand rupees”shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect ~of section 3B
. of Haryana
from the 1st April, 2016. Act 2 of 1975.

Price : 5-00 (5493)



5494

HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA)), AUG. 31, 2016 (BHDR. 9, 1938 SAKA)

Amendment of
section 3C of
Haryana Act 2
of 1975.

Amendment of
section 5 of
Haryana Act 2
of 1975.

Amendment of
section 6 of
Haryana Act 2
of 1975.

Amendment of
section 7 of
Haryana Act 2
of 1975.

Amendment of
section 7A of
Haryana Act 2
of 1975.

5. Insection 3C of the principal Act, for the words “ten thousand rupees”, the words “twenty
five thousand rupees” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted with
effect from the 1st April, 2016.

6. Insub-clause (ii) of clause (b) of sub-section (1) of section 5 of the principal Act, for the
words “one thousand five hundred rupees per day”, the words “two thousand rupees per day for
maximum fifteen days in a month” shall be substituted with effect from the 1st September, 2016.

7. Insub-sections (2) and (3) of section 6 of the principal Act, for the word “telephone”, the
words “telephone and one mobile phone” shall be substituted respectively and shall be deemed
to have been substituted with effect from the 1st April, 2016.

8. In clause (a) of sub-section (1) of section 7 of the principal Act, for the words “two lac
rupees”, the words “three lakh rupees” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from the 1st April, 2016.

9. Clause (b) of sub-section (4) of section 7A of the principal Act shall be omitted.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 31, 2016 (BHDR. 9, 1938 SAKA) 5495

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

At present MLAs are being paid Salary @ Rs.30,000/- per month, Constituency Allowance @ Rs.30,000/- per
month, Office Allowance @ Rs.10,000/- per month, Samptuary Allowance @ Rs. 5,000/- per month, Daily Allowance
@ Rs.1,500/- per day, Free travelling facility @ Rs.2.00 lakh per year and Telephone Allowance @ Rs.15,000/- per
month for a telephone at residence under the provisions of the Haryana Legislative Assembly (Salary, Allowances
and Pension of Members) Act, 1975.

Keeping in view the rise in the cost of living, it is proposed to increase the Salary of Members of Legislative
Assembly from Rs.30,000/- per month to Rs. 40,000/- per month, Constituency Allowance @ Rs.30,000/- per month
to Rs.60,000/- per month, Office Allowance @ Rs.10,000/- per month to Rs.25,000/- per month, Sumptuary
Allowance @ Rs. 5,000/- per month to Rs. 10,000/, Daily Allowance @ Rs.1,500/- per day to Rs.2,000/- per day for
maximum 15 days in a month, Free travelling facility @ Rs.2.00 lakh per year to Rs.3.00 lakh per year and Telephone
Allowance @ Rs.15,000/- per month for a telephone at residence is being substituted to a telephone and a Mobile
phone for residence. It is also proposed to omit the Section 7A (4) (b) of the ibid Act.

RAM BILAS SHARMA,
Parliamentary Affairs Minister, Haryana.

The Governor has, in pursuance of Clauses (1) and (3) of Article 207 of the Constitution of India, recommended
to the Haryana Legislative Assembly the introduction and consideration of the Bill.

Chandigarh: R. K. NANDAL,
The 31st August, 2016. Secretary.



5496 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA)), AUG. 31, 2016 (BHDR. 9, 1938 SAKA)

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

The proposed increase in Salary, Constituency Allowance, Office Allowance, Secretarial Allowance, Daily
Allowance and Free Travel Facility of Members of Legislative Assembly will entail an extra expenditure of
approximately ¥9,04,14,000/- (Rupees nine crore four lakhs and fourteen thousand only) per year from the State

Exchequer. The amount of Daily Allowance can not be ascertained at this stage as this will depend upon the tours of
Members.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 31, 2016 (BHDR. 9, 1938 SAKA) 5497

Eforga srgare)
2016 &1 faElg® A=AT 34—THoUdlolo
FRAOT fdu= w91 (USw 94+, Wi 7 4ve) Weneq faeae, 2016
AT fdum w91 (WS 999, | 9T 99E)
IfeifraH, 1975, @1 I St
o @ fag
fadae

YRd TORY & dsdcd ay¥ § gRIon g faurvved grr fF=fafRad wu & I
sfafafad g —

1. Iz Jffem eRan e | (SR 9a+, Wil dem UeE) e AfSfgH, 2016, W T
HET ST AHT B |

2. BRIOT QU 99T (T dad, ol dor ueH) Irff e, 1975 (RT1, 399, S 918, 1975 @

Tl AR Fer T R), F RN 26 F, WG IR $UV” TRl B WM W, AN FAR A 5

T Treq ufcRenfud fhy TG qen ue eriid, 2016 W UfoRenfud fhy g AHS S | Wﬁ%
SNICEE

3. o A @ g 3% H, AN R P Wkl & WM R, 916 g9k S Y 1975 B

gferenfud feu SITaT qerr gem e, 2016 & gforenfid fhv 1T HHST S0 | gk
srfSfre 2 @

EIRT 3P Bf
HE |
4. Fd ARFRE P GORT 39 H, UE BOR S0 ¥EI B WM R, T BOR WY T 1975 B

gfarenfud feu ST T yerm el 2016 W UfeRenfid fbw U a8y SId | giRam
rfafray 2 &

HRT 39 Pl
HI |
5. o ARAFEH P gRT 3T H, T IR YU AUR] D @I W, TR BOR DU’ e 1975 ol

ﬁmﬁﬁﬁ?qw@amqwaﬁazmeﬁuﬁ?wmwﬂﬂsﬁﬁwﬂ gk
| 2 &1

EIRT 37T hT
e |
6. o AR B ORI 5 B IU-GRT (1) & @Us (@) & Iu—w@oe (i) H, "Ufy fa7 g 1975 o1
R U A TR gt @ e W, el A oritedd ue A @ forg ufy 3w o1 e 5
TR U veg URRMT fhy STUN dor e RYTWR, 2016 W URRenmfd by Y wESr o 2

e A
7. o AMAFTH @ ORT 6 @ [JU-GRT (2) qAT (3) H, "TABM TR b WM WX, HIEIJ: 1975 BT
TABI TAT UH AETES B IeE TR fhY GG qei werd ofid, 2016 & ufieenfug SR 5
by 7T THST S | IFRRT 2

EIRT 6 Pl
A |

8. o IANTH & URT 7 B SU—URT (1) & WS () H, "I oG I A&l & WA 1975 3T
R, TRT T e uferenfia fry ST e ver oiid, 2016 & ufeRenfyd fpy g ERAT
THS TG | e 2
ERT 7 DT
e |
9. WA AT @ gRT 786 B SU-URT (4) & WS (@) FT Y H A7 Q| 1975 T
srferfras 2
BT URT 7H
BT A |




5498 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA)), AUG. 31, 2016 (BHDR. 9, 1938 SAKA)

IRl td RN P faaxor
gIaA 7 BRI AU T & FERT BT 30,000 /— FUY URY AN I, 30,000 /— SO Uiy A fated
&3 W, 10,000 / — U U AT BT Hedl, AchbR Ml 5,000 /— SUd Ui A4, 1,500 /— 0 ufa e
<1 9T, gomd ATAT JAET 2,00 G U 4T 99 UG 15,000 /— FUA GRA A IMATH W Th CellbIA & fog
CIBIA 9o, BRATON e |97 (Fe Ia, 9ol a1 URMF) SIfSRM, 1975 & UMg SR fdm ST <&
2l

SHEAIART a¥gAl B Dol § ISl & g I8 UTad fbar 11 € fb e+ 30,000 /— w9 Ufel
A A 9eTHY 40,000 /— BUY, fated &3 Al 30,000/ — U UfY ANT ¥ §GTHR 60,000 / — U, HIATAA
T 10,000 / — DU UfT AT | F@TdhR 25,000 / — U, FAchR AT 5,000 / — B9 Y AT I 9@THY 10,000 / —
T0d, <f® Wl 1,500 /— U U e | @@ 2,000/ — U Af¥wan 15 &A1 & forw ufdy wre, gwd a0
Jraar 2.00 AT FU UT 94 H IIHR 3.00 ARI U YT IY UG A W U CellhiA & oY Sellhie el
15,000 / — B9 I TR IMMANT TR Th <ollhlA 3R TP Hdlsdl B & oIy SelhIa Wl 15,000 /— B9
gfd 919 R e Se | Ig A uwarad 2 6 ufiRe vl 9 Sad ST @1 9T 786 @ SU-aRT (4)(@)
BT T fhar S|

M faemr o,
FAET drd 74, sRarom |

IRA & AU & JJe] 207 B WU (1) TAT (3) B AERVT H [SJUTA -1 SRATOM e |1 & 39
e &1 Uvgd &3 T 39 W faaR ax &1 RwiRe @ 2|

aﬂé Te: 3No Eﬁo v_-l-a@l,
faTe 31 IRA, 2016. g |



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 31, 2016 (BHDR. 9, 1938 SAKA) 5499

fa<fia ==
I GigeT § RArfad Il fHy S @ Welawy ISTHY TR ST 9,04,14,000 /%9 (Al FRI€ IR ol

dlgs Bk $WY) URT ay SIfIRad Tl QT | 36 WR WR &fFid Al &l AR BT AFAM o1 AT ST FehelT
FRAfp J AT B SRI W IR o |

54618—H.V.S.—H.G.P., Chd.



